
eDocPrinter PDF
Product Level Feature Matrix

Features: EPDFRPO EPDFADV EPDFENT

Ø Page Setup: Custom and user defined paper forms V V V

Ø Page Setup: N-up & booklet mode V V V

Ø Page Setup: Auto selected and fixed paper source V V V

Ø Compression: Downsampling and compression V V V

Ø Compression: Image uniqueness detection V V V

Ø
Compression: Automatic white opaque rectangle 
detection and removal V V V

Ø
Fonts: Subset font embedding: (OpenType, TrueType, 
Type1, Unicode and CJK encoding support) V V V

Ø Fonts: Automatic smart quotes detection and conversion V V V

Ø Fonts: Automatic soft-hyphen detection and conversion V V V

Ø
Fonts: [Text2Hash Addin] To scramble font encoding to 
prevent content text copying V V

Ø
Fonts: [Remap Addin] User defined character encoding 
remapping V

Ø
Doc Info: Standard and user defined document 
information fields V V Vinformation fields

Ø Doc Info: Open action and viewer preference settings V V V

Ø Doc Info: PDF/A-1a and PDF/A-1b compliance V V V

Ø
Security: Standard PDF security and permission settings 
with 40/128 bit encryption V V V

Ø
Security: [AES Addin] Advanced PDF security and 
permission settings with AES 128/256 bit encryption V V

Ø
Watermark: User defined text/image/compound 
watermark with selective page range V V V

Ø
Watermark: [Admin] Global predefined watermarks and 
mandatory watermarks V V V

Ø Watermark: Text watermark with URL action V V V
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Ø
Watermark: Resolving environment variables in text 
watermarks V V V

Ø
Watermark: [Adv. Variables Addin] Resolving Adv. 
variables (page number, date, time, and etc.) in text 
watermarks

V V

Ø Links: Automatic URL and filename pattern detection V V V

Ø
Bookmarks: Automatic bookmark generation by text 
attributes matching V V V

Ø
Destination: Flexible saveas modes (interactive and 
silent) V V V

Ø
Destination: Merge to the existing PDF file by 
[Append/Insert before/Overlay onto] V V V

Ø
Destination: Auto-numbered the destination PDF 
filename V V V

Ø Destination: Optimized for fast web view mode V V V

Ø
Destination: User defined post-action commandline for 
processing the destination PDF V V V

Ø
Destination: Overlay with/Merge with predefined PDF 
templates. V V V

Ø
Destination: Overlay with predefined PDF templates as 
background/foreground/inserting before/appending 
modes.

V V V

Ø

Destination: Overlay with predefined PDF templates with 
single page repeating, even-odd page repeating, multi-
page repeating, mapping one by one, 
prepending/appending, applying cover and back-cover of 
template pages.

V V V

Ø
Destination: Overlay with predefined PDF templates as 
layers V V V

Ø
Destination: Processing sequentially mode for silent 
printing with synchronization V V V
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Ø
Destination: [Embedded commands] Fully controllable 
destination options (e.g. saveas modes, destination 
path) by commands for workflow automation

V V V

Ø
Email: Send PDF as attachment by default email client in 
Simple MAPI/E-MAPI/Outlook Automation modes. V V V

Ø
Email: Send PDF as attachment by default email client in 
Simple MAPI/E-MAPI/Outlook Automation modes. V V V

Ø Email: Send PDF as attachment by Lotus Notes client V V

Ø
Email: Send PDF as attachment by standard SMTP 
mode. V V V

Ø
Email: [SSL Addin] Send PDF as attachment by secured 
SMTP SSL and SMTP STARTTLS mode. V

Ø
Email: [SSL Addin] Send PDF as attachment by secured 
Gmail SMTP/IMAP extension mode. V

Ø
Email: [Embedded commands] Fully controllable email 
options by commands for workflow automation V V V

Ø Email: Resolving environment variables in email fields V V V

Ø
Email: [Adv. Variable Addin] Resolving Adv. variables in 
email fields V V

Ø
Redirect: [Redirect2Print Addin] Redirect the current 
printing job to other printers by printing the spool job file. V V

Ø
Redirect: [Redirect2Print Addin] Redirect the current 
printing job to other printers by calling the PDF Reader 
command line or openaction.

V V

Ø
Redirect: [Redirect2Print Addin] Redirect the current 
printing job as images (BMP/JPG/TIFF). V V

Ø
Redirect: [Embedded commands] Fully controllable 
redirect options by commands for workflow automation V V

Ø
Redirect: [Adv. Variable Addin] Resolving session id and 
client name in adv. variables in the printer name 
argument in remote desktop (terminal server) sessions.

V V
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Ø
FTP/Cloud: Support FTP/SFTP (FTP over SSH)/FTPS 
(FTP over SSL) for uploading files directly after 
conversion.

V

Ø
FTP/Cloud: Support uploading files directly to Amazon 
S3 after conversion. V

Ø
FTP/Cloud: [Embedded commands] Fully controllable 
upload options by commands for workflow automation V

Ø
Embedded commands: Support detecting commands 
embedded in printable text string for automating 
Destination/Email/Security/Doc Info/Overlay with options.

V V V

Ø
Embedded commands: Support detecting commands 
embedded in printable text string for adding PDF layers. V V V

Ø
Embedded commands: Support detecting commands 
embedded in printable text string for automating Adv. 
pack functions like Redirect and AES encryption.

V V

Ø
Embedded commands: [Command2Action Addin] Adv. 
commands for adding bookmarks, comments, link 
annotations, images, embedded files, and etc.

V V

Ø
Embedded commands: [Command2Form Addin] Adv. 
commands for adding PDF form fields and etc. V V

Embedded commands: [Adv. Variable Addin] Adv. 

Ø

Embedded commands: [Adv. Variable Addin] Adv. 
variables used in commands for resolving variables with 
dynamic values like date, time, page number, destination 
path, and et cetera in addition to environment variables.

V V

Ø
Embedded commands: Support detecting commands 
embedded in printable text string for automating Ent. 
pack functions like FTP/Cloud Upload and PDFSealer 
signing.

V

Ø
Admin: Support multiple edocprinter instances with 
independent profile settings. V V V

Ø
Admin: Support simultaneous usage by multiple users in 
remote sessions with independent per-user settings. V V V

Ø
Admin: Support prohibiting to load per-user settings of 
specific property pages by HKLM registry settings V V V

Ø
Admin: Support hiding property pages by HKLM registry 
settings. V V V
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Ø
Admin: Support stamping mandatory watermark and 
showing selectable predefined global watermarks for all 
users by HKLM registry settings.

V V V

Ø
Admin: Support loading global default and MUST 
settings by local HKLM registry. V V V

Ø
Admin: [Remote2Reg Addin] Support loading global 
default and MUST settings from a remote server HKLM 
registry.

V V

Ø
Office Addin: Standard Office Addins (Word/Excel/PPT) 
for supporting conversion of bookmarks, links, cross 
references, and etc. from Office documents.

V V V

Ø
Drag2PDF: Drag and drop UI for simplifying print to 
create PDF conversion. V V

Ø
Drag2PDF:Support [Convert and merge into one PDF 
file] mode. V V

Ø
Drag2PDF: Convert images (BMP/GIF/JPG/TIFF) to 
PDF directly. V V

Ø
Drag2PDF: Support processing existing PDF files with 
applying Doc Info, Security, Watermarks, Overlay with 
PDF templates, and et cetera.

V V

Ø Drag2PDF: Merge PDF files V V

Ø Drag2PDF: Extract/Delete/Divide/Set PDF Pages V V

Ø
PDFSealer: Digitally signing PDF with Windows 
certificate management with user defined signature 
appearance.

V

Ø
PDFSealer: Certifying PDF files without changes with 
digital signing. V

Ø
PDFSealer: Digitally signing and certifying PDF with 
SHA-256, SHA-384, and SHA-512. V

Ø
PDFSealer: Integrate seamlessly with eDocPrinter 
workflow for digitally signing and certifying PDF files 
after conversion.

V

Ø
PDFSealer: Fully controllable PDFSealer options by 
commands for workflow automation. V
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